2015 Fall Vehicle Bid

**AWARDS ARE SUBJECT TO CHANGE

Future Orders

$ 2.00

0.50

0.50

$ 1.78

0.25

3.00

$ 3.00

1.50

1.25

1.00

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

BILLION AUTO GROUP #2

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 1
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size
Exceptions:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Nissan NV 2500

Ram Promaster

GMC Savana

No Bid

No Bid

40,167.00

$ 26,513.00

35,870.00

40,167.00

$ 26,513.00

35,870.00

Not 4WD or AWD

No Block Heater

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 2
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size
Exceptions:

Ford F350 XL

Ford F350 XL

No Bid

Chevrolet 3500

Chevrolet 3500

Ram 3500

No Bid

GMC 3500

No Bid

Ram 3500

$ 38,323.91

38,166.35

$ 38,405.15

38,359.00

41,056.00

37,496.00

42,245.00

$ 38,323.91

38,166.35

$ 38,405.15

38,359.00

41,056.00

37,496.00

42,245.00

6.7L Diesel

6.7L V8 Diesel

6.6L

6.6L Diesel

6.7L Diesel

6.0 V8

6.7L V6

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 3
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size
Exceptions:

Ford F250 XL

Ford F250 XL

No Bid

Chevy 2500

Chevrolet 2500

Ram 2500

No Bid

GMC 2500

No Bid

Ram 2500

$ 29,461.32

29,239.47

$ 29,234.00

30,271.00

41,347.00

29,482.00

33,794.00

$ 29,461.32

29,239.47

$ 29,234.00

30,271.00

41,347.00

29,482.00

33,794.00

6.2L

6.2L V8

6.0L V8

6.0L V8

5.7L V8

6.0Vv8

5.7L V8

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 4
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size
Exceptions:

No Bid

Ford F350 XL

No Bid

Chevy 3500

Chevrolet 3500

Ram 3500

No Bid

GMC 3500

No Bid

Ram 3500

38,586.50

$ 38,016.81

38,710.00

41,889.00

37,697.00

42,279.00

38,586.50

$ 38,016.81

38,710.00

41,889.00

37,697.00

42,279.00

6.7L V8 Diesel

6.6L Diesel

6.6L Diesel

6.7L Diesel

6.6 Diesel

6.7L

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 5

Cancelled Line on Addendum #1

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 6
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size
Exceptions:

No Bid

Ford Transit Connect XL

No Bid

Chevy City Express

No Bid

Nissan NV 200

Dodge Caravan

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

21,866.94

$ 20,053.86

20,243.00

$ 22,657.00

31.0921

34.9238

34.9328

25.9349

$11,256.88

$10,021.82

$10,019.24

$13,495.33

33,123.82

$ 30,075.68

30,262.24

$ 36,152.33

2.5L

2.0L

2.0L V4

3.6V6

Did not meet specifications

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 7
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

Ford Fusion Hybrid

Ford Fusion Hybrid S

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Chrysler 200 Lx

No Bid

Buick LaCrosse

Toyota Camry Hybrid

No Bid

$ 23,616.22

23,497.34

20,779.00

28,278.00

24,522.00

59.411

59.411

36.5912

38.0961

57.44

$5,891.16

$5,891.16

$9,565.14

$9,187.29

$6,093.31




TOTAL BID PRICE 29,507.38 29,388.50 30,344.14 37,465.29 30,615.31

Engine Size 2.0L 2.0L 2.4L - 4 Cylinder 2.4L Eassist 2.5L

Exceptions:

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 8

MFG/MDL No Bid No Bid No Bid Chevy Malibu Chevrolet Malibu Nissan Altima Chrysler 200 LX Honda Accord Toyota Camry Chrysler 200 X

PRICE BID (EACH) 18,164.03 20,080.00 20,908.00 | $ 20,779.00 23,430.00 20,969.00 21,541.00
CAFE CODE 39.2891 39.2891 31.1844 36.5912 39.3283 38.1862 36.5912

CAFE PRICE $8,908.32 $8,908.32 $11,223.56 $9,565.14 $8,899.44 $9,165.61 $9,565.14

TOTAL BID PRICE 27,072.35 28,988.32 32,131.56 | $ 30,344.14 32,329.44 30,134.61 31,106.14
Engine Size 2.5L 2.5L 4 Cylinder 2.5L - 4 Cylinder 2.4L - 4 Cylinder 2.4L 4 Cyl 2.5L 2.4L
Exceptions:

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 9

MFG/MDL No Bid Ford Explorer No Bid Chevrolet Equinox Chevrolet Equinox Dodge Journey No Bid GMC Terrain No Bid Dodge Journey
PRICE BID (EACH) 27,981.00 20,866.11 22,412.00 25,589.00 22,095.00 27,224.00
CAFE CODE 24.4531 30.7928 30.7928 25.257 30.7928 25.257

CAFE PRICE $14,313.11 $11,366.29 $11,366.29 $13,857.54 $11,366.29 $13,857.54

TOTAL BID PRICE 42,294.11 32,232.40 33,778.29 39,446.54 33,461.29 41,081.54
Engine Size 3.5L V6 2.4L 2.4L 4 Cyl 3.6L - V6 2.4L 4 Cyl 3.6L
Exceptions:

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 10

MFG/MDL No Bid No Bid No Bid Chevy Colorado Chevrolet Colorado Nissan Frontier No Bid GMC Canyon No Bid No Bid

PRICE BID (EACH) 28,794.81 27,823.00 25,203.00 31,233.00

CAFE CODE 25.8651 25.8651 22.2783 25.8651

CAFE PRICE $13,531.75 $13,531.75 $15,710.35 $13,531.75

TOTAL BID PRICE 42,326.56 41,354.75 40,913.35 44,764.75

Engine Size 3.6L V6 3.6L V6 4.0L - V6 3.6L V6

Exceptions:
VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 11

MFG/MDL 2015 F150 XLT Ford F150 XL Ford F150 XLT Chevy 1500 Chevrolet 1500 Ram 1500 No Bid GMC 1500 No Bid Ram 1500

PRICE BID (EACH) 28,884.29 27,604.68 28,927.68 27,004.86 27,120.00 31,703.00 26,944.00 32,519.00
CAFE CODE 20.4821 20.4821 20.4821 23.0686 23.4597 19.616 23.4612 19.616

CAFE PRICE $17,088.09 $17,088.09 $17,088.09 $15,172.14 $14,919.20 $17,842.58 $14,918.25 $17,842.58

TOTAL BID PRICE 45,972.38 44,692.77 46,015.77 42,177.00 42,039.20 49,545.58 41,862.25 50,361.58
Engine Size 5.0L 5.0L V8 5.0L V8 5.3L V8 5.3L V8 5.7L - V8 5.3L V8 5.7L V8
Exceptions: No Adjustable Lumbar
VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 12

MFG/MDL Ford F250 XL Ford F250 XL No Bid Chevy 2500 Chevrolet 2500 Ram 2500 No Bid GMC 2500 No Bid Ram 2500

PRICE BID (EACH) 28,767.13 28,404.42 28,111.35 29,016.00 32,897.00 27,746.00 35,479.00
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE 28,767.13 28,404.42 28,111.35 29,016.00 32,897.00 27,746.00 35,479.00
Engine Size 6.2L 6.2L V8 6.0L V8 6.0L V8 5.7L - V8 6.0L V8 5.7L V8
Exceptions:
VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 13

MFG/MDL Ford F250 XL Ford F250 XL No Bid Chevy 2500 Chevrolet 2500 Ram 2500 No Bid GMC 2500 No Bid Ram 2500

PRICE BID (EACH) 30,355.08 30,002.42 29,137.50 29,875.00 31,899.00 28,997.00 33,925.00
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE 30,355.08 30,002.42 29,137.50 29,875.00 31,899.00 28,997.00 33,925.00
Engine Size 6.2L 6.2L V8 6.0L V8 6.0L V8 5.7L - V8 6.0L V8 5.7L V8
Exceptions:
VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto




LINE NO. 14
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size
Exceptions:

Ford F250 XL

Ford F250 XL

No Bid

No Bid

Chevrolet 2500

Ram 2500

No Bid

GMC 2500

No Bid

Ram 2500

29,079.08

28,837.72

29,375.00

31,416.00

28,558.00

34,349.00

29,079.08

28,837.72

29,375.00

31,416.00

28,558.00

34,349.00

6.2L

6.2L V8

6.0L V8

6.0L V8

5.7L V8

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 15
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size
Exceptions:

Cancelled Line

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Nissan NV 2500

No Bid

GMC Savana

No Bid

No Bid

40,167.00

34,958.00

40,167.00

34,958.00

4.8L V8

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 16
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size
Exceptions:

No Bid

Ford Expedition XL

No Bid

Chevy Tahoe

Chevrolet Tahoe

Dodge Durango

No Bid

GMC Yukon

No Bid

Dodge Durango

32,793.55

35,566.25

36,277.00

28,747.00

37,097.00

32,637.00

21.3023

23.0686

23.0686

25.2654

23.0686

25.2654

$16,430.15

$15,172.14

$15,172.14

$13,852.94

$15,172.14

$13,852.94

49,223.70

50,738.39

51,449.14

42,599.94

52,269.14

46,489.94

3.5L V6

5.3L V8

5.3L V8

3.6L - V6

5.3L V8

3.6L - V6

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 17
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size
Exceptions:

New Lowest Bid

Cancelled Line

Ford F250 XL

Ford F250 XL

No Bid

Chevy 2500

Chevrolet 2500

No Bid

No Bid

GMC 2500

No Bid

Ram 2500

28,076.21

27,742.37

31,799.50

29,016.00

26,815.00

29,963.00

28,076.21

27,742.37

31,799.50

29,016.00

26,815.00

29,963.00

6.2L

6.2L V8

6.0L V8

6.0L V8

6.0L V8

5.7L - V8

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 18
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size

Exceptions:

Ford F150 XLT

Ford F150 XL

Ford F150 XLT

Chevy 1500

Chevrolet 1500

Ram 1500

No Bid

GMC1500

No Bid

Ram 1500

27,699.28

26,304.98

27,627.98

26,660.36

26,620.00

30,317.00

26,385.00

32,101.00

20.4821

20.4821

20.4821

23.0686

23.4597

19.616

23.4612

19.616

$17,088.09

$17,088.09

$17,088.09

$15,172.14

$14,919.20

$17,842.58

$14,918.25

$17,842.58

44,787.37

43,393.07

44,716.07

41,832.50

41,539.20

48,159.58

41,303.25

49,943.58

5.0L

5.0L V8

5.0L V8

5.3L V8

5.3L V8

5.7L V8

5.3L V8

5.7L V8

No Adjustable Lumbar

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 19
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size
Exceptions:

Ford F250 XL

Ford F250 XL

No Bid

Chevy 2500

Chevrolet 2500

Ram 2500

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Ram 2500

28,915.87

28,910.62

28,723.50

29,375.00

32,215.00

33,694.00

28,915.87

28,910.62

28,723.50

29,375.00

32,215.00

33,694.00

6.2L

6.2L V8

6.0L V8

6.0L V8

5.7L V6

5.7L V8

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 20
MFG/MDL
PRICE BID (EACH)

Ford F150 XLT

Ford F150 XL

Ford F150 XLT

Chevy 1500

Chevrolet 1500

Ram 1500

No Bid

GMC 1500

No Bid

Ram 1500

30,643.47

29,274.65

30,507.73

33,811.76

33,147.00

30,167.00

29,371.00

33,994.00




CAFE CODE 20.4821 20.4821 20.4821 23.0686 23.4597 21.6435 23.4612 21.6435

CAFE PRICE $17,088.09 $17,088.09 $17,088.09 $15,172.14 $14,919.20 $16,171.14 $14,918.25 $16,171.14

TOTAL BID PRICE 47,731.56 46,362.74 47,595.82 48,983.90 48,066.20 46,338.14 44,289.25 50,165.14
Engine Size 5.0L 5.0L V8 5.0L V8 5.3L V8 5.3L V8 5.7L V8 5.3V8 5.7L V8
Exceptions: No Adjustable Lumbar

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 21

MFG/MDL No Bid Ford Expedition XL No Bid No Bid Chevrolet Tahoe No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Dodge Durango
PRICE BID (EACH) 30,301.25 36,293.00 32,662.00
CAFE CODE 21.3023 23.0686 25.2654

CAFE PRICE $16,430.15 $15,172.14 $13,852.94

TOTAL BID PRICE 46,731.40 51,465.14 46,514.94
Engine Size 3.5L Ecoboost V6 5.3L V8 3.6L
Exceptions:

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 22

MFG/MDL No Bid Ford Expedition EL XL No Bid Chevy Suburban Chevrolet Suburban No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

PRICE BID (EACH) 34,452.25 39,098.25 38,310.00

CAFE CODE 21.0442 23.8945 22.806

CAFE PRICE $16,631.66 $14,647.72 $15,346.84

TOTAL BID PRICE 51,083.91 53,745.97 53,656.84

Engine Size 3.5L Ecoboost V6 5.3L V8 5.3L V8

Exceptions:

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 23

MFG/MDL No Bid Ford Expedition XL No Bid Chevy Tahoe Chevrolet Tahoe No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Dodge Durango
PRICE BID (EACH) 30,289.25 35,766.00 36,293.00 33,262.00
CAFE CODE 21.3023 23.0686 23.0686 25.2654

CAFE PRICE $16,430.15 $15,172.14 $15,172.14 $13,852.94

TOTAL BID PRICE 46,719.40 50,938.14 51,465.14 47,114.94
Engine Size 3.5L Ecoboost V6 5.3L V8 5.3L V8 3.6L V6
Exceptions:

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 24

MFG/MDL Ford F150 XLT Ford F150 XL Ford F150 XLT Chevy 1500 Chevrolet 1500 Ram 1500 No Bid No Bid No Bid Ram 1500

PRICE BID (EACH) 28,099.29 26,990.73 28,313.73 26,600.00 27,120.00 30,187.00 31,994.00
CAFE CODE 20.4821 20.4821 20.4821 23.0686 23.0686 19.616 19.616

CAFE PRICE $17,088.09 $17,088.09 $17,088.09 $15,172.14 $15,172.14 $17,842.58 $17,842.58

TOTAL BID PRICE 45,187.38 44,078.82 45,401.82 41,772.14 42,292.14 48,029.58 49,836.58
Engine Size 5.0L 5.0L V8 5.0L V8 5.3L V8 5.3L V8 5.7L- V8 5.7L V8
Exceptions: No Adjustable Lumbar

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 25

MFG/MDL Ford F150 XLT Ford F150 XL Ford F150 XLT Chevy 1500 Chevrolet 1500 Ram 1500 No Bid No Bid No Bid Ram 1500

PRICE BID (EACH) 30,493.49 29,476.73 30,637.73 30,958.76 29,616.00 32,225.00 34,915.00
CAFE CODE 20.4821 20.4821 20.4821 23.0686 23.0686 19.616 19.616

CAFE PRICE $17,088.09 $17,088.09 $17,088.09 $15,172.14 $15,172.14 $17,842.58 $17,842.58

TOTAL BID PRICE 47,581.58 46,564.82 47,725.82 46,130.90 44,788.14 50,067.58 52,757.58
Engine Size 5.0L 5.0L V8 5.0L V8 5.3L V8 5.3L V8 5.7L V8 5.7L V8
Exceptions: No Adjustable Lumbar

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 26

MFG/MDL Ford F150 XLT Ford F150 XL No Bid Chevy 1500 Chevrolet 1500 Ram 1500 No Bid No Bid No Bid Ram 1500

PRICE BID (EACH) 30,493.49 29,476.23 30,958.76 29,616.00 32,225.00 31,233.00
CAFE CODE 20.4821 20.4821 23.0686 23.4597 19.616 19.616

CAFE PRICE $17,088.09 $17,088.09 $15,172.14 $14,919.20 $17,842.58 $17,842.58

TOTAL BID PRICE 47,581.58 46,564.32 46,130.90 44,535.20 50,067.58 49,075.58




Engine Size
Exceptions:

5.0L

5.0L V8

5.3L V8

5.3L V8

5.7L V8

5.7L V8

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 27
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size
Exceptions:

Ford F150 XLT

Ford F150 XL

Ford F150 XLT

No Bid

Chevrolet 1500

Ram 1500

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Ram 1500

29,943.49

28,920.98

30,081.98

29,116.00

31,555.00

33,715.00

20.4821

20.4821

20.4821

23.4597

19.616

19.616

$17,088.09

$17,088.09

$17,088.09

$14,919.20

$17,842.58

$17,842.58

47,031.58

46,009.07

47,170.07

44,035.20

49,397.58

51,557.58

5.0L

5.0L V8

5.0L V8

2.3L V8

5.7L -V8

5.7L V8

No Adjustable Lumbar

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 28
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size
Exceptions:

Ford F250 XL

Ford F250 XL

No Bid

No Bid

Chevy 2500

Ram 2500

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Ram 2500

29,317.93

29,396.37

29,875.00

30,885.00

30,695.00

29,317.93

29,396.37

29,875.00

30,885.00

30,695.00

6.2L

6.2L V8

5.7L V8

5.7L V8

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 28a
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size
Exceptions:

Ford F250 XL

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Chevrolet 2500

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Ram 3500

29,465.08

29,875.00

34,655.00

29,465.08

29,875.00

34,655.00

6.2L

6.0L V8

6.4L V8

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 29
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size
Exceptions:

Ford F350 XL Cab & Chassis

Ford F350 Chassis XL

No Bid

No Bid

Ram 3500

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Ram 2500

$

32,099.57

32,658.01

30,840.00

33,539.00

32,099.57

32,658.01

30,840.00

33,539.00

6.2L

6.2L V8

6.4L - V8

5.7L V8

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 30
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size
Exceptions:

New Low Bid

Cancelled Line

No Bid

Ford F250XL

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Ram 2500

No Bid

GMC 2500

No Bid

Ram 2500

27,768.37

31,385.00

27,317.00

33,539.00

27,768.37

31,385.00

27,317.00

33,539.00

6.2L V8

5.7L-V8

6.0L V8

5.7L V8

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 31
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size
Exceptions:

Ford Escape SE

Ford Escape SE

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Jeep Patriot

Buick Encore

No Bid

Jeep Patrior

22,264.58

22,096.34

23,870.00

22,630.00

23,499.00

32.8874

32.8874

30.2655

35.694

30.2655

$10,642.37

$10,642.37

$11,564.32

$9,805.57

$11,564.32

32,906.95

32,738.71

35,434.32

32,435.57

35,063.32

1.6L

1.6L

2.4L -4 Cylinder

14L4Cyl

2.4L - 4 Cylinder

No Block Heater

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 32




MFG/MDL Ford F150 XLT Ford F150 XL Ford F150 XLT Chevy 1500 Chevrolet 1500 Ram 1500 No Bid GMC 1500 No Bid Ram 1500

PRICE BID (EACH) 27,237.44 25,930.48 27,095.98( $ 26,286.11 26,106.00 30,569.00 25,895.00 34,296.00
CAFE CODE 20.4821 20.4821 20.4821 23.0686 23.0686 19.616 23.0686 19.616

CAFE PRICE $17,088.09 $17,088.09 $17,088.09 $15,172.14 $15,172.14 $17,842.58 $15,172.14 $17,842.58

TOTAL BID PRICE 44,325.53 43,018.57 44,184.07 | $ 41,458.25 41,278.14 48,411.58 41,067.14 52,138.58
Engine Size 5.0L 5.0L V8 5.0L V8 5.3L V8 5.3L V8 5.7L V8 5.3L V8 5.7L V8
Exceptions:

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 33

MFG/MDL Ford F250 XL Ford F250 XL No Bid Chevy 2500 Chevrolet 2500 No Bid No Bid GMC 2500 No Bid Ram 2500

PRICE BID (EACH) 29,085.92 27,846.37 $ 28,416.96 28,351.00 27,987.00 29,939.00
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE 29,085.92 27,846.37 $ 28,416.96 28,351.00 27,987.00 29,939.00
Engine Size 6.2L 6.2L V8 6.0L V8 6.0L V8 6.0L V8 5.7L V8
Exceptions:

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 34

MFG/MDL Ford F150 XLT Ford F150 XL No Bid No Bid Chevrolet 1500 Ram 1500 No Bid GMC 1500 No Bid Ram 1500

PRICE BID (EACH) 30,083.49 29,379.23 32,755.00 28,614.00 29,696.00
CAFE CODE 20.4821 20.4821 23.4597 19.616 23.4597 19.616

CAFE PRICE $17,088.09 $17,088.09 $14,919.20 $17,842.58 $14,919.20 $17,842.58

TOTAL BID PRICE 47,171.58 46,467.32 #VALUE! 50,597.58 43,533.20 47,538.58
Engine Size 5.0L 5.0L V8 5.3L V8 5.7L- V8 5.3L V8 5.7L- V8
Exceptions:

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 35 No Bid Awarded

MFG/MDL No Bid Ford F350 Chassis XL No Bid No Bid Chevrolet 3500 Ram 3500 No Bid GMC 3500 No Bid Ram 3500

PRICE BID (EACH) 39,682.35 37,252.00 44,381.00 36,349.00 43,858.00
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE 39,682.35 37,252.00 44,381.00 36,349.00 43,858.00
Engine Size 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.6L V8 Diesel 6.7L Diesel 6.6 Diesel 6.7L Diesel
Exceptions:

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 36

MFG/MDL Ford Escape SE Ford Escape SE No Bid No Bid No Bid Jeep Patriot No Bid Buick Encore No Bid Jeep Patriot

PRICE BID (EACH) 22,237.85 22,128.64 23,990.00 22,580.00 22,582.00
CAFE CODE 32.8874 32.8874 30.2655 35.694 30.2655

CAFE PRICE $10,642.37 $10,642.37 11,564.32 $9,805.57 $11,564.32

TOTAL BID PRICE 32,880.22 32,771.01 35,554.32 32,385.57 34,146.32
Engine Size 1.6L 1.6L Ecoboost 2.4L - 4 Cylinder 1.4L 4 Cyl 2.4L - 4 Cylinder
Exceptions: Delivery and Block Heater

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 37

MFG/MDL No Bid Ford Explorer No Bid Chevy Equinox Chevrolet Equinox Dodge Journey No Bid GMC Terrain No Bid Jeep Grand Cherokee
PRICE BID (EACH) 28,029.46 $ 21,197.61 25,260.00 25,584.00 25,162.00 31,108.00
CAFE CODE 24.4531 25.2919 24.1463 24.4714 24.1463 19.0572

CAFE PRICE $14,313.11 $13,838.42 $14,494.97 $14,302.41 $14,494.97 $18,365.76

TOTAL BID PRICE 42,342.57 $ 35,036.03 39,754.97 39,886.41 39,656.97 49,473.76
Engine Size 3.5L V6 2.4L 3.6L V6 3.6L -V6 3.6L V6 3.6L - V6
Exceptions: Does not meet HP and Torque

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 38 Awarded

MFG/MDL Ford Escape SE Ford Escape SE No Bid No Bid No Bid Jeep Patrior No Bid Buick Encore No Bid Jeep Patriot

PRICE BID (EACH) 22,237.85 21,518.64 23,875.00 22,580.00 22,692.00
CAFE CODE 32.8874 32.8841 30.2655 35.694 30.2655




CAFE PRICE $10,642.37 $10,643.44 $11,564.32 $9,805.57 $11,564.32

TOTAL BID PRICE 32,880.22 32,162.08 35,439.32 $ 32,385.57 34,256.32
Engine Size 1.6L 1.6L Ecoboost 2.4L - 4 Cylinder 1.4L 4 Cyl 2.4L - 4 Cylinder
Exceptions:

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 39 Awarded

MFG/MDL No Bid Ford Expedition XL No Bid No Bid Chevrolet Tahoe Dodge Durango No Bid GMC Yukon No Bid Dodge Durango

PRICE BID (EACH) 32,244.55 $ 36,277.00 27,916.00 $ 36,425.00 30,936.00
CAFE CODE 21.3023 23.0686 25.2654 23.0686 25.2654

CAFE PRICE $16,430.15 $15,172.14 $13,852.94 $15,172.14 $13,852.94

TOTAL BID PRICE 48,674.70 $ 51,449.14 41,768.94 $ 51,597.14 44,788.94
Engine Size 3.5L V6 Ecoboost 5.3L V8 3.6 V6 5.3L V8 3.6L V6
Exceptions:

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 40 Awarded

MFG/MDL Ford Taurus SEL Ford Taurus SEL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Buick LaCrosse No Bid Chysler 300

PRICE BID (EACH) 423.31 25,095.96 $ 33,091.00 29,494.00
CAFE CODE 29.5688 27.2264 26.0357 24.6534

CAFE PRICE $11,836.80 $12,855.17 $13,443.08 $14,196.82

TOTAL BID PRICE 12,260.11 37,951.13 $ 46,534.08 43,690.82
Engine Size 3.5L 3.2L V6 3.6L V6 3.6L V6
Exceptions: Bid Amount Error

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 41

MFG/MDL Ford Focus SE Ford Focus SE No Bid No Bid No Bid Dodge Dart No Bid Buick Verano No Bid Dodge Dart

PRICE BID (EACH) 16,331.19 16,277.64 18,990.00 $ 21,962.00 18,074.00
CAFE CODE 41.2498 41.2498 36.2993 32.7628 36.2993

CAFE PRICE $8,484.89 $8,484.89 $9,642.06 $10,682.85 $9,642.06

TOTAL BID PRICE 24,816.08 24,762.53 28,632.06 $ 32,644.85 27,716.06
Engine Size 2.0L 2.0L 2.0L 4 Cylinder 2.4L 4 Cyl 2.4L

Exceptions:
VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 42

MFG/MDL Ford Fusion SE Ford Fusion SE No Bid Chevy Impala Chevrolet Impala Limited No Bid No Bid Buick LaCrosse Toyota Avalon Chrysler 300

PRICE BID (EACH) 18,433.09 18,338.64 22,525.10| $ 18,174.00 $ 28,353.00 28,300.00 29,494.00
CAFE CODE 34.6744 34.6744 27.6533 28.1841 27.6533 32.56 23

CAFE PRICE $10,093.90 $10,093.90 $12,656.72 $12,418.35 $12,656.72 $10,749.39 $15,217.39

TOTAL BID PRICE 28,526.99 28,432.54 35,181.82 [ $ 30,592.35 $ 41,009.72 39,049.39 44,711.39
Engine Size 2.5L 2.5L 2.5L 3.6L V6 3.6L V6 3.5L 3.6L V6
Exceptions:
VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 43

MFG/MDL Ford Escape SE Ford Escape SE NoBid No Bid No Bid Jeep Patriot No Bid Honda CRV No Bid Jeep Patriot

PRICE BID (EACH) 22,115.59 22,056.64 23,870.00 $ 25,937.00 23,499.00
CAFE CODE 32.8874 32.8874 30.2655 37.9986 30.2655

CAFE PRICE $10,642.37 $10,642.37 $11,564.32 $9,210.87 $11,564.32

TOTAL BID PRICE 32,757.96 32,699.01 35,434.32 $ 35,147.87 35,063.32
Engine Size 1.6L 1.6L 2.4L - 4 Cylinder $ 2.40 2.4L - 4 Cylinder
Exceptions:
VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 44

MFG/MDL No Bid Ford Expedition XL No Bid No Bid Chevrolet Tahoe No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Dodge Durango

PRICE BID (EACH) 29,662.25 $ 36,293.00 37,577.00
CAFE CODE 21.3023 23.0686 25.264

CAFE PRICE $16,430.15 $15,172.14 $13,853.70




TOTAL BID PRICE 46,092.40 51,465.14 51,430.70
Engine Size 3.5L Ecoboost V6 5.3L V8 5.7L-V8
Exceptions:

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 45

MFG/MDL Ford F150 XLT Ford F150 XL Ford F150 XLT No Bid Chevrolet 1500 Ram 1500 No Bid GMC 1500 No Bid Ram 1500

PRICE BID (EACH) $ 24,699.91 23,147.48 24,531.98 23,827.00 27,138.00 23,081.00 29,201.00
CAFE CODE 22.1329 22.1329 22.1239 24.0492 21.6435 23.4612 22.3445

CAFE PRICE $15,813.56 $15,813.56 $15,820.00 $14,553.50 $16,171.14 $14,918.25 $15,663.81

TOTAL BID PRICE $ 40,513.47 38,961.04 40,351.98 38,380.50 43,309.14 37,999.25 44,864.81
Engine Size 5.0L 5.0L V8 5.0L V8 5.3L V8 5.7L V8 5.3L V6 5.7L V8
Exceptions: No Adjustable Lumbar

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 46 Cancelled Line on Addendum #1

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 47

MFG/MDL Ford F150 XLT Ford F150 XL Ford F150 XLT No Bid Chevrolet 1500 Ram 1500 No Bid GMC 1500 No Bid Ram 1500

PRICE BID (EACH) $ 27,699.29 26,096.48 27,251.98 26,106.00 29,900.00 25,556.00 31,058.00
CAFE CODE 20.4821 20.4821 20.4821 23.4597 19.616 23.4612 23.4612

CAFE PRICE $17,088.09 $17,088.09 $17,088.09 $14,919.20 $17,842.58 $14,918.25 $14,918.25

TOTAL BID PRICE $ 44,787.38 43,184.57 44,340.07 41,025.20 47,742.58 40,474.25 45,976.25
Engine Size 5.0L 5.0L V8 5.0L V8 5.3L V8 5.7L V8 5.3L V8 5.7L V8
Exceptions: No Adjustable Lumbar

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 48 Cancelled Line

MFG/MDL Ford F150 XLT Ford F150 XL Ford F150 XLT No Bid Chevrolet 1500 Ram 1500 No Bid GMC 1500 No Bid Ram 1500

PRICE BID (EACH) $ 30,083.42 28,793.48 29,951.98 28,963.00 31,650.00 27,064.00 33,475.00
CAFE CODE 20.4821 20.4821 20.4821 23.4597 19.616 23.4612 19.616

CAFE PRICE $17,088.09 $17,088.09 $17,088.09 $14,919.20 $17,842.58 $14,918.25 $17,842.58

TOTAL BID PRICE $ 47,171.51 45,881.57 47,040.07 43,882.20 49,492.58 41,982.25 51,317.58
Engine Size 5.0L 5.0L V8 5.0L V8 5.3L V8 5.7L- V8 5.3L V8 5.7L V8
Exceptions: No Adjustable Lumbar

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 49

MFG/MDL Ford F150 XLT Ford F150 XL Ford F150 XLT No Bid Chevrolet 1500 Ram 1500 No Bid GMC 1500 No Bid Ram 1500

PRICE BID (EACH) $ 27,063.55 25,670.48 26,901.48 26,506.00 30,310.00 26,029.00 31,405.00
CAFE CODE 22.1329 22.1329 22.1329 23.4597 21.6435 23.4612 22.3445

CAFE PRICE $15,813.56 $15,813.56 $15,813.56 $14,919.20 $16,171.14 $14,918.25 $15,663.81

TOTAL BID PRICE $ 42,877.11 41,484.04 42,715.04 41,425.20 46,481.14 40,947.25 47,068.81
Engine Size 5.0L 5.0L V8 5.0L V8 5.3L V8 5.7L- V8 5.3L V8 5.7L- V8
Exceptions: No Adjustable Lumbar

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 50 Cancelled Line on Addendum #1

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 51 Cancelled Bid

MFG/MDL Ford F250 XL Ford F250 XL No Bid No Bid Chevrolet 2500 Ram 2500 No Bid GMC 2500 No Bid Ram 2500

PRICE BID (EACH) $ 27,406.93 27,092.62 28,516.00 31,015.00 27,879.00 32,743.00
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE $ 27,406.93 27,092.62 28,516.00 31,015.00 27,879.00 32,743.00
Engine Size 6.2L 6.2L V8 6.0L V8 5.7L-v8 6.0L V8 5.7L- V8
Exceptions:

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 52 Cancelled Bid

MFG/MDL Ford F250 XL Ford F250 XL No Bid No Bid Chevrolet 2500 Ram 2500 No Bid GMC 2500 No Bid Ram 2500

PRICE BID (EACH) $ 24,693.59 24,428.62 25,857.00 28,602.00 24,294.00 31,057.00
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE




TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size
Exceptions:

24,693.59

24,428.62

25,857.00

28,602.00

24,294.00

31,057.00

6.2L

6.2L V8

6.0L V8

5.7L -V8

6.0L V8

5.7L-V8

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 53
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size
Exceptions:

Cancelled Bid

Ford F250 XL

Ford F250 XL

No Bid

No Bid

Chevrolet 2500

Ram 2500

No Bid

GMC 2500

No Bid

Ram 2500

24,867.86

24,597.62

25,905.00

28,891.00

24,476.00

31,326.00

24,867.86

24,597.62

25,905.00

28,891.00

24,476.00

31,326.00

6.2L

6.2L V8

6.0L V8

5.7L -V8

6.0L V8

5.7L-V8

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 54
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size
Exceptions:

Cancelled Bid

Ford F250 XL

Ford F250 XL

No Bid

No Bid

Chevrolet 2500

Ram 2500

No Bid

GMC 2500

No Bid

Ram 2500

27,527.21

27,187.62

28,516.00

30,820.00

26,255.00

33,039.00

27,527.21

27,187.62

28,516.00

30,820.00

26,255.00

33,039.00

6.2L

6.2L V8

6.0L V8

5.7L -V8

6.0 V8

5.7L V8

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 55
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size
Exceptions:

Cancelled Bid

Ford F250 XL

Ford F250 XL

No Bid

No Bid

Chevrolet 2500

Ram 2500

No Bid

GMC 2500

No Bid

Ram 2500

27,596.88

27,370.62

28,521.00

31,082.00

26,448.00

33,206.00

27,596.88

27,370.62

28,521.00

31,082.00

26,448.00

33,206.00

6.2L

6.2L V8

6.0L V8

5.7L -V8

6.0L V8

5.7L V8

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 56
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size

Exceptions:

Cancelled Bid

Ford F250 XL

Ford F250 XL

No Bid

No Bid

Chevrolet 2500

Ram 2500

No Bid

GMC 2500

No Bid

No Bid

28,037.71

27,688.62

29,314.00

30,820.00

26,698.00

28,037.71

27,688.62

29,314.00

30,820.00

26,698.00

6.2L

6.2L V8

6.0L V8

5.7L -V8

6.0L V8

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 57
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size
Exceptions:

Ford F250 XL

Ford F250 XL

No Bid

No Bid

Chevrolet 2500

Ram 2500

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Ram 2500

28,246.37

25,986.62

27,139.00

28,685.00

31,157.00

28,246.37

25,986.62

27,139.00

28,685.00

31,157.00

6.2L

6.2L V8

6.0L V8

5.7L -v8

5.7L V8

VENDORS

REHBEIN FORD

BISON FORD

BISON FORD #2

Karl Tyler Chevrolet

City Motors

BILLION AUTO GROUP

Biilion Auto Group Alternate

Helena Auto Center

Helena Motors

Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 58
MFG/MDL

PRICE BID (EACH)
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE
Engine Size

Ford F250 XL

Ford F250 XL

No Bid

No Bid

Chevrolet 2500

Ram 2500

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Ram 2500

28,376.93

26,150.62

27,316.00

30,221.00

31,199.00

28,376.93

26,150.62

27,316.00

30,221.00

31,199.00

6.2L

6.2L V8

6.0L V8

5.7L -V8

5.7L V8




Exceptions:

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 59

MFG/MDL No Bid Ford Transit 250 No Bid No Bid Chevrolet Express Nissan NV 2500 Ram Promaster 1500 GMC Savana No Bid No Bid

PRICE BID (EACH) $ 25,563.48 24,301.00 27,787.00| $ 26,329.00 24,687.00

CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE $ 25,563.48 24,301.00 27,787.00 | $ 26,329.00 24,687.00

Engine Size 3.5L Ecoboost V6 4.8L V8 4.0L V6 3.6L V6 4.8L V8

Exceptions:
VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 60

MFG/MDL No Bid Ford Transit Connect XL No Bid No Bid No Bid Dodge Caravan No Bid Honda Odyssey Toyota Sienna Dodge Caravan
PRICE BID (EACH) $ 23,650.64 25,812.00 30,672.00 28,219.00 26,294.00
CAFE CODE 31.0921 25.9349 28.9732 26.81 25.9349

CAFE PRICE $11,256.88 $13,495.33 $12,080.13 $13,054.83 $13,495.33

TOTAL BID PRICE $ 34,907.52 39,307.33 42,752.13 41,273.83 39,789.33
Engine Size 2.5L 3.6L - V6 3.5L V6 3.5L V6 3.6L V6
Exceptions: Sliding Doors are not power
VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 61 Cancelled Line

MFG/MDL Ford F350 XL Cab & Chassis Ford F350 Chassis XL No Bid No Bid No Bid Ram 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid Ram 3500

PRICE BID (EACH) $ 24,947.74| $ 25,010.26 30,460.00 28,109.00
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE $ 24,947.74| $ 25,010.26 30,460.00 28,109.00
Engine Size 6.2L 6.2L V8 6.4L - V8 6.4L V8
Exceptions:
VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Helena Auto Center
LINE NO. 62 Cancelled Line

MFG/MDL Ford F350 XL Cab & Chassis Ford F350 XL No Bid No Bid Chevrolet 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ram 3500

PRICE BID (EACH) $ 26,853.63| $ 27,143.62 27,460.00 32,213.00
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE $ 26,853.63| $ 27,143.62 27,460.00 32,213.00
Engine Size 6.2L 6.2L V8 6.0L V8 6.4L V8
Exceptions:

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 63

MFG/MDL Ford F350 XL Ford F350 XL No Bid No Bid Chevrolet 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ram 3500

PRICE BID (EACH) $ 29,446.59 | $ 29,127.62 30,615.00 36,319.00
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE $ 29,446.59 | $ 29,127.62 30,615.00 36,319.00
Engine Size 6.2L 6.2L V8 6.0L V8 6.4L V8
Exceptions:

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 64

MFG/MDL Ford F350 XL Ford F350 XL No Bid No Bid Chevrolet 3500 Ram 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid Ram 3500

PRICE BID (EACH) $ 28,213.93| $ 27,969.62 29,068.00 33,686.00 34,546.00
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE $ 28,213.93| $ 27,969.62 29,068.00 33,686.00 34,546.00
Engine Size 6.2L 6.2L V8 6.0L V8 5.7L V6 6.4L V8
Exceptions: Does not meet engine size

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 65

MFEG/MDL

Ford F350 XL

Ford F350 XL

No Bid

No Bid

Chevrolet 3500

Ram 3500

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Ram 3500




PRICE BID (EACH) 28,386.93 28,143.62 29,266.00 32,814.00 34,715.00
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE 28,386.93 28,143.62 29,266.00 32,814.00 34,715.00
Engine Size 6.2L 6.2L V8 6.0L V8 5.7L - V8 6.4L V8
Exceptions: Does not meet engine size
VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 66

MFG/MDL Ford F50 XL Ford F250 XL No Bid No Bid Chevrolet 2500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ram 2500

PRICE BID (EACH) 27,638.88 27,320.65 28,351.00 32,885.00
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE 27,638.88 27,320.65 28,351.00 32,885.00
Engine Size 6.2L 6.2L V8 6.0L V8 5.7L V8
Exceptions:
VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 67

MFG/MDL No Bid Ford Expedition EL XL No Bid No Bid Chevrolet Suburban No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

PRICE BID (EACH) 34,452.25 38,310.00

CAFE CODE 21.0442 22.806

CAFE PRICE $16,631.66 $15,346.84

TOTAL BID PRICE 51,083.91 53,656.84

Engine Size 3.5L Ecoboost V6 5.3L V8

Exceptions:

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 68

MFG/MDL Ford F250 XL Ford F250 XL No Bid No Bid Chevrolet 2500 Ram 2500 No Bid No Bid No Bid Ram 2500

PRICE BID (EACH) 28,847.81 28,602.62 28,821.00 32,231.00 29,214.00
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE 28,847.81 28,602.62 28,821.00 32,231.00 29,214.00
Engine Size 6.2L 6.2L V8 6.0L V8 5.7L V8 5.7L V8
Exceptions:

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 69

MFG/MDL No Bid Ford F350 XL No Bid No Bid Chevrolet 3500 Ram 3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid Ram 3500

PRICE BID (EACH) 30,727.62 30,998.00 33,286.00 36,209.00
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE 30,727.62 30,998.00 33,286.00 36,209.00
Engine Size 6.2L V8 6.0L V8 5.7L V8 6.4L V8
Exceptions: Does not meet engine size

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 70

MFG/MDL No Bid Ford F250 XL No Bid No Bid Chevrolet 2500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ram 2500

PRICE BID (EACH) 34,749.35 35,250.00 33,826.00
CAFE CODE

CAFE PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE 34,749.35 35,250.00 33,826.00
Engine Size 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.6L Diesel 5.7L V8
Exceptions:

VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 71

MFG/MDL Ford F150 XLT Ford F150 XL Ford F150 XLT No Bid Chevrolet 1500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ram 1500

PRICE BID (EACH) 24,699.91 23,179.98 24,571.98 23,827.00 29,261.00
CAFE CODE 22.1329 22.1329 22.1329 24.0492 19.616

CAFE PRICE $15,813.56 $15,813.56 $15,813.56 $14,553.50 $17,842.58




TOTAL BID PRICE 40,513.47 38,993.54 40,385.54 38,380.50 47,103.58
Engine Size 5.0L 5.0L V8 5.0L V8 5.3L V8 5.7L V8
Exceptions: No Adjustable Lumbar
VENDORS REHBEIN FORD BISON FORD BISON FORD #2 Karl Tyler Chevrolet City Motors BILLION AUTO GROUP Biilion Auto Group Alternate Helena Auto Center Helena Motors Livingston Auto

LINE NO. 72

MFG/MDL Ford F150 XLT Ford F150 XL Ford F150 XLT No Bid Chevrolet 1500 Ram 1500 No Bid No Bid No Bid Ram 1500

PRICE BID (EACH) 27,063.55 25,662.98 26,893.98 26,506.00 30,515.00 29,211.00
CAFE CODE 22.1329 22.1329 22.1329 24.0492 20.4256 20.4256

CAFE PRICE $15,813.56 $15,813.56 $15,813.56 $14,553.50 $17,135.36 $17,135.36

TOTAL BID PRICE 42,877.11 41,476.54 42,707.54 41,059.50 47,650.36 46,346.36
Engine Size 5.0L 5.0L V8 5.0L V8 5.3L V8 5.7L- V8 5.7L V8

Exceptions:

No Adjustable Lumbar
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