
***AWARDS ARE SUBJECT TO CHANGE 
VENDORS BISON FORD Bison Ford Alternate Livingston Auto Duval Ford Billion Auto Group
LINE NO. 1
MFG/MDL Ford Police Interceptor Sedan Ford Police Interceptor Sedan No Bid Ford Police Interceptor Sedan No Bid
PRICE BID (EACH)  $                                        26,476.70  $                                        30,130.70  $                                27,735.00 
Engine Size 3.5L V6 w/288 HP 3.5L Ecoboost V6 w/365 HP 3.5L V6 TIVCT

Police Pursuit Rated?
Exceptions: 288 HP All Wheel Drive
VENDORS BISON FORD Bison Ford Alternate Livingston Auto Duvall Ford Billion Auto Group
LINE NO. 2
MFG/MDL Ford F250 No Bid No Bid Ford F250 Ram 2500
PRICE BID (EACH)  $                                        37,156.59  $                                37,287.00  $                             41,088.00 
Engine Size 6.2L V8 6.2L V8 5.7 V8
Police Pursuit Rated?

Exceptions:
VENDORS BISON FORD Bison Ford Alternate Livingston Auto Duvall Ford Billion Auto Group
LINE NO. 3
MFG/MDL Ford Police Interceptor Sedan No Bid No Bid Ford Police Interceptor Sedan No Bid
PRICE BID (EACH)  $                                        30,103.70  $                                28,735.00 
Engine Size 3.5L Ecoboost V6 3.7L V6 TIVCT
Police Pursuit Rated?

Exceptions:
Does not meet HP 305 should be 

minimum 350
VENDORS BISON FORD Bison Ford Alternate Livingston Auto Duvall Ford Billion Auto Group
LINE NO. 4
MFG/MDL Ford Police Interceptor Sedan Ford Police Interceptor Sedan No Bid Ford Police Interceptor Sedan No Bid
PRICE BID (EACH)  $                                        26,516.70  $                                        27,516.70  $                                27,735.00 
Engine Size 3.5L V6 w/288 HP 3.7L V6 w/305HP 3.5L V6 TIVCT
Police Pursuit Rated?

Exceptions: 288 HP All Wheel Drive

2015 Fall Pursuit Vehicle Bid



VENDORS BISON FORD Bison Ford Alternate Livingston Auto Duvall Ford Billion Auto Group
LINE NO. 5
MFG/MDL No Bid No Bid Dodge Charger Pursuit No Bid Dodge Charger Pursuit
PRICE BID (EACH) $31,981.00 $32,233 
Engine Size 5.7L V8 5.7 V8
Police Pursuit Rated?

Exceptions:
VENDORS BISON FORD Bison Ford Alternate Livingston Auto Duvall Ford Billion Auto Group
LINE NO. 6
MFG/MDL Ford Police Interceptor SUV No Bid No Bid Ford Interceptor SUV No Bid
PRICE BID (EACH)  $                                        29,644.56  $                                31,056.00 
Engine Size 3.7L V6 3.7L V6 TIVCT
Police Pursuit Rated?

Exceptions:
VENDORS BISON FORD Bison Ford Alternate Livingston Auto Duvall Ford Billion Auto Group
LINE NO. 6a
MFG/MDL Ford Police Interceptor SUV No Bid No Bid Ford Police Interceptor SUV No Bid
PRICE BID (EACH)  $                                        32,568.12  $                                33,988.00 
Engine Size 3.5 V6 Ecoboost 3.5 V6 Ecoboost
Police Pursuit Rated?

Exceptions:
VENDORS BISON FORD Bison Ford Alternate Livingston Auto Duvall Ford Billion Auto Group
LINE NO. 7
MFG/MDL Ford Police Interceptor SUV No Bid No Bid Ford Interceptor SUV No Bid
PRICE BID (EACH)  $                                        35,291.12  $                                34,172.00 
Engine Size 3.5L Ecoboost V6 w/365HP 3.5L V6 Ecoboost
Police Pursuit Rated?

Exceptions:
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